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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 5, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

  
Group 1 Pipe Restraining System for PVC Bell & Spigot Joints
  UNIT     

5 ea.    (SAWS #15266)     PRICE 23.90 25.00 34.68 33.46
1. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for PVC TOTAL 119.50 125.00 173.40 167.30

 UNIT

70 ea.   (SAWS #15262) PRICE 30.60 32.00 41.76 44.28
2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 2,142.00 2,240.00 2,923.20 3,099.60

 UNIT

100 ea.   (SAWS #15263) PRICE 47.15 49.00 61.48 72.02
3. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 4,715.00 4,900.00 6,148.00 7,202.00
  UNIT

 5 ea. (SAWS #15260) PRICE 82.00 84.00 108.73 126.27
4. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for PVC TOTAL 410.00 420.00 543.65 631.35

 UNIT

75 ea.   (SAWS #15242) PRICE 89.75 94.00 117.06 137.69
5. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 6,731.25 7,050.00 8,779.50 10,326.75

 UNIT

15 ea.    (SAWS #15261)     PRICE 226.05 237.00 296.00 322.88
6. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for PVC TOTAL 3,390.75 3,555.00 4,440.00 4,843.20

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #32427) PRICE 395.30 414.00 503.00 500.81
7. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for PVC TOTAL 1,976.50 2,070.00 2,515.00 2,504.05

UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #15244) PRICE 462.55 484.00 620.00 639.88
8. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 24" used for PVC TOTAL 11,563.75 12,100.00 15,500.00 15,997.00

 *    
 GROUP 1 TOTAL TOTAL 31,048.75 32,460.00 41,022.75 44,771.25

    
Mfr Brand Ford 1390C Ford Meter Box Ford EBAA

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star 1100C 1390 Series UFR1390-C-RB-1 Bell Restraint
  
Group 2 Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Bell & Spigot Joints TOTAL

  UNIT

5 ea.(SAWS #30161) PRICE 23.90 25.00 34.68 33.73
1. Restratint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for DI TOTAL 119.50 125.00 173.40 168.65

UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #30162) PRICE 30.60 32.00 41.76 48.48
2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL 765.00 800.00 1,044.00 1,212.00

UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #30163) PRICE 47.15 49.00 61.48 65.52
3. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL 1,178.75 1,225.00 1,537.00 1,638.00

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #30164) PRICE 82.00 83.00 108.73 114.40
4. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for DI TOTAL 410.00 415.00 543.65 572.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 5, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY T
en
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UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #30165) PRICE 89.75 94.00 117.06 143.23
5. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL 2,243.75 2,350.00 2,926.50 3,580.75

UNIT

 5 ea. (SAWS #30166) PRICE 236.47 464.00 529.00 321.06
6. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for DI TOTAL 1,182.35 2,320.00 2,645.00 1,605.30

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #32428) PRICE 678.35 711.00 808.00 502.20
7. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for DI TOTAL 3,391.75 3,555.00 4,040.00 2,511.00

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #30168) PRICE 855.65 897.00 1,000.00 650.42
8. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 24" used for DI TOTAL 4,278.25 4,485.00 5,000.00 3,252.10

 *    
 GROUP 2 TOTAL TOTAL 13,569.35 15,275.00 17,909.55 14,539.80

 Ford Meter Box   
Mfr Brand Ford 1390C 1390 Series Ford EBAA 1700 Series

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star 1100C 1490 Series UFR1390-C-RB-1 Pushon Harness
 
GROUP 3 Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for PVC Pipe

UNIT     
20 ea. (SAWS #15265) PRICE 15.85 17.00 28.73 22.81

1. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for PVC TOTAL 317.00 340.00 574.60 456.20
UNIT

500 ea.  (SAWS #15255) PRICE 19.26 20.00 36.86 27.64
2. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 9,630.00 10,000.00 18,430.00 13,820.00

UNIT

250 ea.  (SAWS #15257) PRICE 28.50 29.00 48.25 40.92
3. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 7,125.00 7,250.00 12,062.50 10,230.00

UNIT

 10 ea.  (SAWS #15246) PRICE 53.90 55.00 81.71 77.36
4. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for PVC TOTAL 539.00 550.00 817.10 773.60

UNIT     
150 ea. (SAWS #15248) PRICE 56.75 59.00 85.38 81.30

5. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 8,512.50 8,850.00 12,807.00 12,195.00
UNIT

50 ea.  (SAWS #15250) PRICE 125.90 131.00 174.20 174.05
6. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for PVC TOTAL 6,295.00 6,550.00 8,710.00 8,702.50

UNIT

10 ea.  (SAWS #45452) PRICE 193.60 202.00 252.00 267.64
7. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for PVC TOTAL 1,936.00 2,020.00 2,520.00 2,676.40

UNIT

20 ea.  (SAWAS 15258) PRICE 223.60 234.00 302.00 308.89
8. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for PVC TOTAL 4,472.00 4,680.00 6,040.00 6,177.80

 *    
 GROUP 3 TOTAL TOTAL 38,826.50 40,240.00 61,961.20 55,031.50

    
Mfr Brand UFR-1500 Ford Ford Meter Box Ford EBAA Iron

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star 4000 1500 Series UFR1500-CA-RB-1 2000 Series
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 5, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY T
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GROUP 4 Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe

UNIT

20 ea. (SAWS #15253) PRICE 13.10 14.00 25.45 18.57
1. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for DI TOTAL 262.00 280.00 509.00 371.40

UNIT

150 ea. (SAWS #15254) PRICE 15.40 16.00 32.39 21.86
2. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL 2,310.00 2,400.00 4,858.50 3,279.00

UNIT

80 ea. (SAWS #15256) PRICE 23.15 24.00 42.60 33.37
3. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL 1,852.00 1,920.00 3,408.00 2,669.60

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #30172) PRICE 34.30 35.00 60.09 49.39
4. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for DI TOTAL 171.50 175.00 300.45 246.95

UNIT

40 ea.  (SAWS #15247) PRICE 50.00 52.00 78.14 71.87
5. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL 2,000.00 2,080.00 3,125.60 2,874.80

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15249) PRICE 94.70 99.00 140.53 131.07
6. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for DI TOTAL 473.50 495.00 702.65 655.35

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15251) PRICE 166.65 174.00 225.00 230.27
7. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for DI TOTAL 833.25 870.00 1,125.00 1,151.35

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15252) PRICE 231.40 242.00 309.00 319.77
8. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for DI TOTAL 1,157.00 1,210.00 1,545.00 1,598.85

*    
GROUP 4 TOTAL TOTAL 9,059.25 9,430.00 15,574.20 12,847.30

    
Mfr Brand Ford-UFR-1400 Ford Meter Box Ford EBAA Iron

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star 3000 1400 Series UFR1400-DA-RB-1 Megalug 1100 Series
 Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for PVC Pipe to 
GROUP 5 Mechanical Joint Fittings

UNIT

20 ea.  (SAWS #30174) PRICE 24.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 497.00

UNIT

20 ea.  (SAWS #30175) PRICE 38.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 761.00

UNIT

15 ea.  (SAWS #15259) PRICE 83.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 1,245.75

*
GROUP 5 TOTAL TOTAL 2,503.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

 
Mfr Brand Romac

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Gripring
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
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 Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Pipe to
GROUP 6 Mechanical Joint Fittings

UNIT

100 ea.  (SAWS #30176) PRICE 24.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL 2,486.00   

UNIT

20 ea.   (SAWS #30177) PRICE 37.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL 752.00   

UNIT

15 ea.  (SAWS #30178) PRICE 83.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL 1,245.75   

*
GROUP 6 TOTAL TOTAL 4,483.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

    
Mfr Brand Romac    

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Grip Ring    
 
GROUP 7 Accessory Sets

UNIT

PRICE

1. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

UNIT

PRICE

2. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

UNIT

PRICE

3. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

UNIT

PRICE

4. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

UNIT

PRICE

5. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

UNIT

PRICE

6. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

UNIT

PRICE

7. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

UNIT

PRICE

8. GROUP 7 ITEM DELETED TOTAL

 

GROUP 7 TOTAL TOTAL

Mfr Brand

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No.
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS
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EXTENSION 1 99,491.35

EXTENSION 2 99,491.35

EXTENSION 3 99,491.35

EXTENSION 4 99,491.35

Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days
 
 
*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Act Pipe and Supply Demandstar
Cohen Industrial Supply SAWS Website
Core & Main
Corix Water Products

Ferguson Waterworks

Fortiline

Gajeski

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

Hydropro Solutions

KLP Commercial
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